
 
 
 
 

 
DAY COURSES… 
 
 
BL 102 New Testament 
Survey This class will survey 
each book of the New 
Testament, giving an outline 
of each book, reviewing the 
main stories, and presenting 
the basic truths.  This course 
provides an excellent basis 
for further intensive study in 
the New Testament. 
Days:  T/TH        Credits 5 
Hours:  2:30 – 4:45 PM 
Instructor:  Daniel Fick 
 
 
BL 530 New Testament 
Analysis  This class will help 
the student survey each book 
of the New Testament on a 
more in-depth basis, 
examining the authorship, 
and basic themes of each 
book.  This course provides 
an excellent basis for further 
study in the New Testament. 
Days:  T/TH        Credits 5 
Hours:  2:30 – 4:45 PM 
Instructor:  Daniel Fick 
 
 
MI 330  Homiletics 1 – 
Preaching and Preachers 
This course is designed to 
help the student grow in a 
love for the primacy of 
preaching. Students will be 
better equipped to 
understand the task of 
preaching, and what is 
expected of those who 
preach the Word.  Students  
 

 
 
will learn general principles 
and methods to best deliver 
God’s Word to God’s people.  
Days:  Thursday  Credits 3 
Hours:  8:30 – 11:45  AM 
Instructor: Gabriel Carlson 
 
MI 540 Missionaries: Lives 
& Lessons  This course will 
examine the life stories of a  
number of missionaries who 
have been used to advance 
the Gospel in various places 
around the world.  The 
students will gain a missions 
perspective as they consider 
life lessons from these faithful 
servants of the Lord. 
Days:  Tuesday  Credits 3 
Hours:  8:30 – 11:45  AM 
Instructor: Shari Carlson 
 
LA 413  Beginning Biblical 
Greek III This course 
continues the study of the 
grammar, syntax, and 
vocabulary of the New 
Testament.  This is part 
three of a three part course. 
In addition to increasing  
vocabulary and grammar 
skills,  students will begin to 
translate various portions of 
Scripture. 
Days:  M/W         Credits 5 
Hours:  12:30-3:00 PM 
Instructor:  Daniel Fick 

 
TH 510 Truth Matters  The 
Christian worldview is in 
conflict with the worldview of 
this postmodern generation.  
At stake is the issue of “What 
is Truth?”  This class will use  

 
 
resources from the “Truth 
Project” as well as other 
resources to equip the 
student in being able to 
address the truth issues that 
are being challenged today. 
Day:  T/TH           Credits 3 
Hours: 12:45–2:15 PM  
Instructor:  Daniel Fick 

 
 
NIGHT COURSES… 
 
 
MI 540 Missionaries: Lives 
& Lessons  This course will 
examine the life stories of a  
number of missionaries who 
have been used to advance 
the Gospel in various places 
around the world.  The 
students will gain a missions 
perspective as they consider 
life lessons from these faithful 
servants of the Lord. 
Day:  Tuesday  2-3 Credits 
Hours:  7 – 9  PM  
Instructor:  Shari Carlson 
 
 
BL 510  Paul: His Life & 
Teachings This class will 
examine the life of Paul, his 
conversion, his missionary 
journeys, and his teachings.  
The course will provide an 
overview of the thirteen 
epistles Paul wrote, and 
present highlights of each of 
these epistles.  
Day:  Thursday  2-3 Credits 
Hours:  7 – 9  PM  
Instructor:  Daniel Fick

 

 

 

SWBC – 2024  Spring QUARTER 


